

**INGHAM COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT**  
**RECORD OF BID/PROPOSAL OPENING**

OPENING STAMP: 03/22/19 AM 11:00 PUR

**PACKET #49-19 Slag 29 A (10,000 m/l tons) and 29 A Crushed Natural Aggregate (500 m/l tons)**

**Attendees:**

Yellow Rose  
 Sunrise Aggregates

Vendor Name	Local Pref	Western - Slag 29A - UNIT PRICE	Western - Slag 29A - TOTAL COST	Eastern - Slag 29A - UNIT PRICE	Eastern - Slag 29A - TOTAL COST	Metro - Slag 29A UNIT PRICE	Metro - Slag 29A - TOTAL COST	Eastern - 3/8 x #4 UNIT PRICE	Eastern - 3/8 x #4 TOTAL PRICE	Western - 29A Crushed Natural Agg - UNIT PRICE	Western - 29A Crushed Natural Agg - TOTAL PRICE	Overall Total	TIME STAMP
Verplank Trucking	No, Ferrysburg MI	\$56.25	\$112,500.00	\$56.25	\$450,000.00	\$56.25	\$56,250.00	\$56.25	\$56,250.00	\$33.25	\$16,625.00	\$691,625.00	03/12/19 AM 10:40 PUR
Yellow Rose Transport Inc.	No, Grandville MI	\$29.00	\$58,000.00	\$29.95	\$239,600.00	\$29.00	\$29,000.00	\$37.00	\$37,000.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$363,600.00	03/22/19 AM 8:17 PUR
Edw C. Levy	No, Detroit MI	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$27.35	\$27,350.00	No Bid	No Bid	\$27,350.00	03/22/19 AM 10:33 PUR
Sunrise Aggregates	Yes, Dansville MI	*	*	*	*	*	*	*	*	\$20.85	\$10,425.00	\$10,425.00	03/22/19 AM 10:49 PUR

\*Non-responsive because vendor did not bid per specifications listed in the RFP for the Slag 29A and 3/8 x #4 .

**Recorder:** Bobbie Mayes

**Witness:** James Hudgins