

INGHAM COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT OPENING STAMP: 03/12/19 AM 11:30 PUR
RECORD OF BID/PROPOSAL OPENING
PACKET #48-19 Emulsified Asphalts

Vendor:	Emulsified Asphalt Designation:	Detention Rates for Unloading:	Price per Gallon:	Approx. # of Gallons:	Approx. Total Cost	Plant or Refinery Location:	
Michigan Paving & Materials Co. Location: Alma, MI Timestamp 03/12/19 AM 10:09 PUR	SS-1H		\$2.20	5,000±	\$11,000.00	Monroe/Alma (MI)	
	Low-Tracking Bond Coat		No Bid	10,000±	-		
	Low-Tracking Bond Coat		No Bid	10,000±	-		
	HFRS-2M	\$100.00/Hour	\$2.05	600,000±	\$1,230,000.00	Monroe/Alma (MI)	
	AE-90 (or qualified equivalent)		\$2.20	10,000±	\$22,000.00	Monroe/Alma (MI)	
	CM-300 (or qualified equivalent)		No Bid	15,000±	-		
	Pug Mill Mobilization Cost						
	Cold Patch Production Costs (per ton):						
	Frieght Cost						
	Truck Availability:						
Bit-Mat Location: Bay City, MI Timestamp 03/12/19 AM 11:12 PUR	SS-1H		No Bid	5,000±	-		
	Low-Tracking Bond Coat		\$1.95	10,000±	\$19,500.00	Bay City (MI)	
	Low-Tracking Bond Coat		No Bid	10,000±	-		
	HFRS-2M	\$105.00/Hour	\$1.76	600,000±	\$1,056,000.00	Bay City (MI)	
	AE-90 (or qualified equivalent)		\$1.65	10,000±	\$16,500.00	Bay City (MI)	
	CM-300 (or qualified equivalent)		No Bid	15,000±	-		
	Pug Mill Mobilization Cost						
	Cold Patch Production Costs (per ton):						
	Frieght Cost						
	Truck Availability:						
Asphalt Materials Location: Oregon, OH Timestamp 03/12/19 AM 11:18 PUR	SS-1H		No Bid	5,000±	-		
	Low-Tracking Bond Coat		No Bid	10,000±	-		
	Low-Tracking Bond Coat		No Bid	10,000±	-		
	HFRS-2M	No Bid	\$2.17	600,000±	\$1,302,000.00	Oregon, OH	
	AE-90 (or qualified equivalent)		No Bid	10,000±	-		
	CM-300 (or qualified equivalent)		3.22	15,000±	48,300.00	Oregon, OH	
	Pug Mill Mobilization Cost	\$1,000.00					
	Cold Patch Production Costs (per ton):	\$3.00 / Ton					
	Frieght Cost	\$ (Included per Gallon)					
	Truck Availability:	5500 Gallon Loads / 9500 Gallon Loads					