

INGHAM COUNTY PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
RECORD OF BID/PROPOSAL OPENING

OPENING STAMP: 10/18/19 AM 11:00 PUR

PACKET #228-19 Single Tungsten Carbide Insert Grader Blades, Jr. Wing Plow Blades and Jr. Wing Plow Shoes

Attendees - Sign by the X, and include the Company name

None

| Vendor Name | Local Pref | Add's | Single Tungsten Carbide Insert Grader Blade (250± each) | Single Tungsten Carbide Insert Grader Blade (250± each) | Junior Wing Plow Blade (50± each) | Junior Wing Plow Blade (50± each) | Junior Wing Plow Shoe (50± each) | Junior Wing Plow Shoe (50± each) | Time Stamp |
|-----------------------------|------------------------------|-------|---|---|--------------------------------------|--------------------------------------|-------------------------------------|-------------------------------------|-----------------------|
| | | | Price / Blade | Total Price (250) | Price / Blade | Total Price (50) | Price / Shoe | Total Price (50) | |
| St. Regis Culvert | No,Charlotte MI | Y | \$207.00 | \$51,750.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | 10/08/19 PM 1:11 PUR |
| Shults Equipment LLC | No,Ithica MI | Y | \$188.00 | \$47,000.00 | \$97.12 | \$4,856.00 | \$135.00 | \$6,750.00 | 10/15/19 AM 11:12 PUR |
| Wear Parts & Equipment | No,Aurora CO | Y | 204.76 | \$51,190.00 | \$96.44 | \$4,822.00 | No Bid | No Bid | 10/16/19 AM 9:45 PUR |
| Michigan CAT | No, Lansing, Eaton County MI | Y | \$210.06 | \$52,515.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | 10/17/19 AM 9:28 PUR |
| Chemung Supply Corp. | No, Elmira NY | Y | \$148.00 | \$37,000.00 | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | No Bid | 10/17/19 AM 10:10 PUR |
| Heights Machinery | No, Williamsburg MI | Y | \$196.21 | \$49,052.50 | \$79.52 | \$3,976.00 | \$40.97 | \$2,048.50 | 10/17/19 AM 2:04 PUR |
| Winter Equipment Co., Inc. | No, Willoughby OH | Y | \$213.52 | \$53,380.00 | \$83.26 | \$4,163.00 | \$30.84 | \$1,542.00 | 10/18/19 AM 8:32 PUR |
| Truck & Trailer Specialties | No, Dutton MI | Y | 190.55 | \$47,637.50 | \$94.31 | \$4,715.50 | \$145.75 | \$7,287.50 | 10/18/19 AM 10:34 PUR |

Recorder: Julie Buckmaster

Witness: James Hudgins